
State of Mississippi 

Department of 

Transportation 

Statewide Agency Contract 

Contract Number
DFA-74507-25

 CERTIFIED BITUMINOUS 

Approval Through 

07/01/2025-12/31/2025



DESTINATION TANK TRUCK PRICE 

PER GALLON 
 SS-1 & 1H CRS-2 CRS-2P ULTRAARMOR

 CSS-1&1H 

(UNDILTED) 

 CSS-1&1H 

(DILUTED 1 TO 

1) FOG SEAL

 CMS-1PF 

(QP) 

 CMS-1PC 

(CR) 
 NTSS-1M CHPF-1 CBC-1H eF-1H BC-1HT MC-30 ePrime

MATERIAL ADJUSTMENT CODE  (A2)  (A2)  (A2)  (A2)  (A2) 

ADAMS

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$   3.4230$  NB 3.4500$   3.3500$   3.2000$   4.9500$   NO BID 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.2000$   4.00$   

ALCORN

ERGON NO BID 3.1020$   3.4430$  NB 3.4700$   3.3700$   3.2200$   4.9700$   NO BID 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5800$   4.00$   

AMITE

ERGON NO BID 3.1020$   3.4430$  NB 3.4700$   3.3700$   3.2200$   4.9700$   NO BID 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.2000$   4.00$   

ATTALA

ERGON NO BID 3.1220$   3.4630$  NB 3.4900$   3.3900$   3.2400$   4.9900$   NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

BENTON

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$   3.4230$  NB 3.4500$   3.3500$   3.2000$   4.9500$   NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

MISSISSIPPI DEPARTMENT

OF

TRANSPORTATION
Tabulation      

Agency Contract Certified Bituminous 

July 1, 2025 through Decemeber 31,2025



BOLIVAR

ERGON NO BID 3.1220$   3.4630$  NB 3.4900$   3.3900$   3.2400$   4.9900$   NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5200$   4.00$   

CALHOUN

ERGON NO BID 3.1220$   3.4630$  NB 3.4900$   3.3900$   3.2400$   4.9900$   NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

CARROLL

ERGON NO BID 3.1320$   3.4730$  NB 3.5000$   3.4000$   3.2500$   5.0000$   NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2000$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

CHICKASAW

ERGON NO BID 3.1420$   3.4830$  NB 3.5100$   3.4100$   3.2600$   5.0100$   NB 3.5100$  3.5100$  3.2600$  3.5100$  5.2600$  3.5600$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5800$   4.00$   

CHOCTAW

ERGON NO BID 3.1720$   3.5130$  NB 3.5400$   3.4400$   3.2900$   5.0400$   NB 3.5400$  3.5400$  3.2900$  3.5400$  5.2900$  3.5900$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5800$   4.00$   

CLAIBORNE

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$   3.4230$  NB 3.4500$   3.3500$   3.2000$   4.9500$   NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

CLARKE

ERGON NO BID 3.1520$   3.4930$  NB 3.5200$   3.4200$   3.2700$   5.0200$   NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  3.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.1500$   3.85$   

CLAY

ERGON NO BID 3.1520$   3.4930$  NB 3.5200$   3.4200$   3.2470$   5.0200$   NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  3.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5800$   4.00$   

COAHOMA

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$   3.4230$  NB 3.4500$   3.3500$   3.2000$   4.9500$   NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

COPIAH

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$   3.4230$  NB 3.4500$   3.3500$   3.2000$   4.9500$   NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.5500$   4.00$   

COVINGTON

ERGON NO BID 3.1020$   3.4430$  NB 3.4700$   3.3700$   3.2200$   4.9700$   NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$    3.2000$   4.00$   



DESOTO

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

FORREST

ERGON NO BID 3.1320$            3.4730$  NB 3.5000$       3.4000$               3.2500$   5.0000$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2500$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

FRANKLIN

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

GEORGE

ERGON NO BID 3.1920$            3.5330$  NB 3.5600$       3.4600$               3.3100$   5.0600$            NB 3.5600$  3.5600$  3.3100$  3.5600$  5.3100$  3.6100$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

GREENE

ERGON NO BID 3.1820$            3.5230$  NB 3.5500$       3.4500$               3.3000$   5.0500$            NB 3.5500$  3.5500$  3.3000$  3.5500$  5.3000$  3.6000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

GRENADA

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    3.85$                  

HANCOCK

ERGON NO BID 3.2120$            3.5530$  NB 3.5800$       3.4800$               3.3300$   5.0800$            NB 3.5800$  3.5800$  3.3300$  3.5800$  5.3300$  3.6300$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

HARRISON

ERGON NO BID 3.2120$            3.5530$  NB 3.5800$       3.4800$               3.3300$   5.0800$            NB 3.5800$  3.5800$  3.3300$  3.5800$  5.3300$  3.6300$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    4.00$                  

HINDS

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

HOLMES

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9600$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

HUMPHREYS

ERGON NO BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  



BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

ISSAQUENA

ERGON NO  BID 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

ITAWAMBA

ERGON NO BID 3.1320$            3.4730$  NB 3.5000$       3.4000$               3.2500$   5.0000$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2500$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

JACKSON

ERGON NO BID 3.2320$            3.5730$  NB 3.6000$       3.5000$               3.3500$   5.1000$            NB 3.6000$  3.6000$  3.3500$  3.6000$  5.3500$  3.6500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

JASPER

ERGON NO BID 3.1120$            3.4530$  NB 3.4800$       3.3800$               3.2300$   4.9800$            NB 3.4800$  3.4800$  3.2300$  3.4800$  5.2300$  3.5300$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

JEFFERSON

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

 

JEFFERSON DAVIS

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

JONES

ERGON NB 3.1320$            3.4730$  NB 3.5000$       3.4000$               3.2500$   5.0000$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2500$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

KEMPER

ERGON NB 3.1520$            3.4930$  NB 3.5200$       3.4200$               3.2700$   5.0200$            NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

LAFAYETTE

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    3.85$                  

LAMAR

ERGON NB 3.1420$            3.4830$  NB 3.5100$       3.4100$               3.2600$   5.0100$            NB 3.5100$  3.5100$  3.2600$  3.5100$  5.2600$  3.5600$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    4.00$                  

LAUDERDALE



ERGON NB 3.1320$            3.4730$  NB 3.5000$       3.4000$               3.2500$   5.0000$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2500$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

LAWRENCE

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

LEAKE

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3600$               3.2100$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2700$                    4.00$                  

LEE

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

LEFLORE

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

LINCOLN

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

LOWNDES

ERGON NB 3.1820$            3.5230$  NB 3.5500$       3.4500$               3.3000$   5.0500$            NB 3.5500$  3.5500$  3.3000$  3.5500$  5.3000$  3.6000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

MADISON

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2700$                    4.00$                  

MARION

ERGON NB 3.1220$            3.4630$  NB 3.4900$       3.3900$               3.2400$   4.9900$            NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

MARSHALL

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.5000$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

MONROE

ERGON NB 3.1420$            3.4830$  NB 3.5100$       3.4100$               3.2600$   5.0100$            NB 3.5100$  3.5100$  3.2600$  3.5100$  5.2600$  3.5600$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  



MONTGOMERY

ERGON NB 3.1220$            3.4630$  NB 3.4900$       3.3900$               3.2400$   4.9900$            NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

NESHOBA

ERGON NB 3.1120$            3.4530$  NB 3.4800$       3.3800$               3.2300$   4.9800$            NB 3.4800$  3.4800$  3.2300$  3.4800$  5.2300$  3.5300$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2700$                    4.00$                  

NEWTON

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

NOXUBEE

ERGON NB 3.1720$            3.5130$  NB 3.5400$       3.4400$               3.2900$   5.0400$            NB 3.5400$  3.5400$  3.2900$  3.5400$  5.2900$  3.5900$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2700$                    4.00$                  

OKTIBBEHA

ERGON NB 3.1720$            3.5130$  NB 3.5400$       3.4400$               3.2900$   5.0400$            NB 3.5400$  3.5400$  3.2900$  3.5400$  5.2900$  3.5900$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

PANOLA

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

PEARL RIVER

ERGON NB 3.1820$            3.5230$  NB 3.5500$       3.4500$               3.3000$   5.0500$            NB 3.5500$  3.5500$  3.3000$  3.5500$  5.3000$  3.6000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

PERRY

ERGON NB 3.1520$            3.4930$  NB 3.5200$       3.4200$               3.2700$   5.0200$            NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  3.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

 

PIKE

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

PONTOTOC

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

PRENTISS

ERGON NB 3.1220$            3.4630$  NB 3.4900$       3.3900$               3.2400$   4.9900$            NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  



QUITMAN

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

RANKIN

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2700$                    4.00$                  

SCOTT

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    4.00$                  

SHARKEY

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

SIMPSON

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

SMITH

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

STONE

ERGON NB 3.1820$            3.5230$  NB 3.5500$       3.4500$               3.3000$   5.0500$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.3000$  3.5500$  5.3000$  3.6000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    3.85$                  

SUNFLOWER

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

TALLAHATCHIE

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

 

TATE

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

TIPPAH

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  



BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

TISHOMINGO

ERGON NB 3.1220$            3.4630$  NB 3.4900$       3.3900$               3.2400$   4.9900$            NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

TUNICA

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

UNION

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

WALTHALL

ERGON NB 3.1220$            3.4630$  NB 3.4900$       3.3900$               3.2400$   4.9900$            NB 3.4900$  3.4900$  3.2400$  3.4900$  5.2400$  3.5400$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

WARREN

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

WASHINGTON

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

WAYNE

ERGON NB 3.1520$            3.4930$  NB 3.5200$       3.4200$               3.2700$   5.0200$            NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  3.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.1500$                    4.00$                  

WEBSTER

ERGON NB 3.1520$            3.4930$  NB 3.5200$       3.4200$               3.2700$   5.0200$            NB 3.5200$  3.5200$  3.2700$  3.5200$  5.2700$  3.5700$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    3.85$                  

WILKINSON

ERGON NB 3.1020$            3.4430$  NB 3.4700$       3.3700$               3.2200$   4.9700$            NB 3.4700$  3.4700$  3.2200$  3.4700$  5.2200$  3.5200$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.2000$                    4.00$                  

WINSTON

ERGON NB 3.1320$            3.4730$  NB 3.5000$       3.4000$               3.2500$   5.0000$            NB 3.5000$  3.5000$  3.2500$  3.5000$  5.2500$  3.5500$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5800$                    4.00$                  

YALOBUSHA



ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            NB 3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5500$                    4.00$                  

YAZOO

ERGON NB 3.0820$            3.4230$  NB 3.4500$       3.3500$               3.2000$   4.9500$            3.4500$  3.4500$  3.2000$  3.4500$  5.2000$  3.5000$  

BLACKLIDGE 3.50$         3.5200$                    4.00$                  

PRICE IF PICKED UP BY MDOT 

PERSONNEL

ERGON NB 2.8800$            3.2230$  3.2500$       3.1500$               3.0000$   4.7500$            3.2500$  3.2500$  3.0000$  3.2500$  5.0000$  3.3000$  

BLACKLIDGE

PLANT LOCATIONS FOR PICKUP BY 

MDOT PERSONNEL

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Blacklidge Emulsions, Inc.

P. O. Box 1639 10480 Reichold Road

Jackson, MS 39215-1639 Gulfport, MS 39503

Amy Walker Jen Myers

601-933-3000 228-863-3878

Fax 601-933-3363 jmyers@blacklidge.com

amy.walker@ergon.com

teresa.purifoy@ergon.com

Vicksburg, MS 39183

Memphis, TN 38113

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc

mailto:jmyers@blacklidge.com
mailto:amy.walker@ergon.com
mailto:teresa.purifoy@ergon.com



